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Raquel Tully ] e Qe Q9 N\ Q
RECEN=7586 & Ser .~ Fnd

From: Nancy Pruitt

Sent:  Wednesday, May 26, 2010 8: 28 PH 3 51 )

To: Raqguel Tully %MY L EOO q _:L\J\;\b

Subject: RE: CUrMiSSiO <K~ - _
CLERK @x

$2,000 is a fine in Docket 100207-TX ($200 to PSC Trust Fund and $1,800 to General Revenue)
$90 in late payment penalty

$18 in interest ! 000 7 _‘7“*)(‘

Nancy Pruitt iT DATE
Florida Public Service Commission D

2540 Shumard Oak Boulevard " -
Tallahassee, FL 32399 046 digl A
850-413-6127

850-413-6128 (fax)

From: Raquel Tully

Sent: Wednesday, May 26, 2010 7:57 AM
To: Nancy Pruitt

Subject:

I received a check from optical telecommunication, in the amount of $2108.00. They only sent in the check, please et me know
the break down
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