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Raquel Tully \ O-\.é\ % o) ) 100 PN 29 —TZF‘
From: Nancy Pruitt I \ ( 700 - ﬂ ﬂ#j
Sent:  Wednesday, June 16, 2010 3:29 PM ‘ Q 6 Q
To: Raquel Tully DEPOSIT DATE
Subject: RE:

050 Juil
This is for Docket No. 100229-T1 050 18 2010

$700 is for RAF; $2,000 is Fine ($200 for PSC Trust Fund and $1,800 for General Revenue)

rdO A

Thank you. o\‘ _

. Q 5 : £ C couerc{
Nancy Pruitt £ 2200 -
Florida Public Service Commission
2540 Shumard Oak Boulevard ' / f’OO _60 - _-:Ztﬂt’/
Tallahassee, FL 32399 / )
850-413-6127 L- /5"

850-413-6128 (fax)

From: Raguel Tully

Sent: Wednesday, June 16, 2010 2:04 PM
To: Nancy Pruitt

Subject:

TJ 501, Telmex USA sent in a raf form with a check in the amount of $2700.00, please let me know the break down.

thanks
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