
From: Nancy Pruitt 

Sent: Monday, July 12,2010 1:2%&L 13 8: 57 
To: Raquel Tully 

Subject: RE: 

This is for Docket No. 100232-TI. 

CO PiH I SS IO 14 
CLERK 

$700 is for RAF, $1 75 is penalty, $42 is interest. $1,000 is the Fine, $200 to PSC Trust Fund and $800 to 
General Revenue. 

Nancy Pruitt DEPOSIT DATE 
Florida Public Service Commission 
2540 Shumard Oak Boulevard 
Tallahassee, FL 32399 

850-413-6128 (fax) 

, 0 5 4 J!lL 1 3  2si3 

850-41 3-61 27 

From: Raquel Tully 
Sent: Monday, July 12,2010 1:13 PM 
To: Nancy Pruitt 
Subjea: 

TJ617, sent in a check with the raf form in the amount of $1917.00 Please let me know the breakdown 

7/12/2010 


