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Raquel Tully 

From: Toni Earnhart 

Sent: 

To: Raquel Tully 

Subject: RE:TX740 Home Town Telephone, LLC 
This is the fine ordered. They paid the RAF, but not the fine. I called them and they FEL%%aif.'- 

Fine $1000 ($200 to PSC Trust Fund and $800 to General Revenue) 

___- 

Wednesday, June 08.201 1 11 :44 AM 

-.-- . .. . 
z 

3 6 ? JUII 1 3  ZoIj 
______ ____ 

From: Raquel Tully 
Sent: Wednesday, lune 08,2011 11:09 AM 
To: Toni Earnhart 
Subject: 

TX740, Docket 110121-TX sent in $1,000.00, there is no paper work, Please let me know the break down 
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