
Raquel Tully 

From: Toni Earnhart 

Sent: 

To: Raquel Tully; Toni Earnhart 

Subject: RE: Lyca Tel, LLC (TK131) Docket No. 110190-TI 
Hi Raquel, 

Monday, July 11,201 1 9:49 AM 

Please apply it as listed below. 

Lyca Tel, LLC (TK131) Docket No. 110190-TI 
2010 RAF $700.00 
Penalty $1 75.00 
Interest $42.00 

Fine Trust Fund and $1800 to 

Thank yau, 

13-6533 Fax Line 

From: Raquel Tully 
Sent: Monday, July 11, 2011 9:39 AM 
To: Toni Earnhart 
Subject: 

I received a check from TK131, Lycatel for $2,917.00. they did not send in a raf form 
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