
August 5,201 1 

Commission Clerk 
Florida Public Service Commission 
2540 Shumard Oak Blvd. 
Tallahassee, FL 32399 

RE: Docket #090477 
Alturas Utilities, LLC SARC 

Dear Clerk, 

Enclosed please find a copy of email history relating to the utility connection of the 
Alturas Elementary School in Alturas, Florida. 

Alturas Utilities, LLC hereby requests an extension to complete the requested proforma 
items until September 15,201 1. 

On behalf of Alturas Utilities, LLC 

Mike Smallridge 
System Manager 

MSAp 
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Subject:RE: Alturas Utilities, Polk County 
From: Coultas, Charles (Charles.Coultas@dep.state.fl.us) 
To: utilityconsul tant@yahoo. com; 
Date: Fri, 04 Feb 201 1 12:17:32 

Hello Mike, 

Our funding for this year is very limited so we cannot pay to connect many folks this year. Next year’s 
funding starts July 201 1 (hopefully we will be funded) and we should move forward with connections at 
that time. 

I was just notified that Alturas Elementary School has some PWS type problems they will have to 
address. What is the cost to provide service to them? Not sure exactly what size meter will be needed 
but I guess a 2” meter. 

I will check with them to see if they will accept a connection. 

Thank you, 

Charles 

The Department of Environmental Protection values your feedback as a customer. DEP Secretary Herschel T. 
Vinyard, Jr. is committed to continuously assessing and improving the level and quality of services provided to 
you. Please take a few minutes to comment on the quality of service you received. Simply click on this link to the 
DEP Customer Survev. Thank you in advance for completing the survey. 

From: Mike Smallridge [mailto:utilityconsultant@yahoo.com] 
Sent: Wednesday, December 29, 2010 6:31 PM 
To: Coultas, Charles 
Subject: Alturas Utilities, Polk County 

Dear Charles, 

http://us.mg3 .mail.yahoo.com/neofaunch?.rand=ao74mp33ci952 8/5/2011 



Print Page 2 of 3 

Using the list of names you emailed to me, My manager and I did a street by street, address by address 
inspection of the utility and found the following: 

Name and address with water line adjacent or across the street that can be connected: 

1. 
2. 
3. 
4. 
5. 
6. 
7. 
8. 
9. 

10. 
11. 
12. 
13. 
14. 

patrick frankenburger- 2205 oak dr. 
alturas elementry school- corner of central & 4th. 
fulton-cole-620 oak dr. 
josefa cavazos-2 190 oak dr. 
andrew talley- 2621 oak dr. 
john serdenski-2900 oak dr. 
r.e. stevens-3 150 central ave 
lou & Cindy stevens-3 150 central ave. 
martha undenvood-3 102 central ave. 
ted serdynski-2 195 oak dr. 
jeanie tilley-3 190 central ave 
car1 hielscher-2555 oak ave 
current resident-2 120 hurley 
merlin or evelyn hielscher- 125 magnolia 

the following customers can be hooked up with a main line extension of 90' or less. 

1. 
2. 
3. 
4. 
5. 
6. 
7. 
8. 
9. 

10. 
11. 
12. 

Paul warren-2984 central 
nick mauel-2980 central 
allen voight-3070 central 
john byrd-2920 central 
Sara popoca-2890 central ave 
bonnie lynn-2940 central ave 
mike riddle-2970 central ave. 
tim griner-3 101 central ave. 
scott barnes-2960 central 
ellie& brenda mole-2990 central ave. 
john allen smith-3040 central ave 
Wanda young-2905 central. 

I hope this helps. Of course I am a utility owner who is always willing to hook up new customers. please 
let me know how we can get this done. 

Mike Smallridge 

Alturas Utilities, LLC. 

http://us.mg3 .mail.yahoo.com/neo/launch?.rand=ao74mp3 3 ci952 
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Subject:RE: Alturas Utilities, Polk County 
From: Coultas, Charles (Charles.Coultas@dep.state.fl.us) 
To: utilityconsultant@yahoo.com; 
Date: Wed, 25 May 201 1 16:30:29 

Hello, That sounds good. provide details of the connection and costs. 

Thanks 

From: Mike Smallridge [mailto:utilityconsultant@yahoo.com] 
Sent: Wednesday, May 25,201 1 4:15 PM 
To: Coultas, Charles 
Subject: Re: Alturas Utilities, Polk County 

Charles, I spoke with the folks at Polk county schools regarding hooking up the Alturas school to our 
system and they want to proceed with doing so. What do you want me do to next? Please advise. 

Sent from my iPad 

Mike Smallridge 

Cell# (352) 302-7406 

On Feb 4,201 1, at 12: 17 PM, "Coultas, Charles" <Charles.Coultas@,dep.state.fl.us> wrote: 

Hello Mike, 

Our funding for this year is very limited so we cannot pay to connect many folks this year 
Next year's funding starts July 201 1 (hopefully we will be funded) and we should move 
forward with connections at that time. 

I was just notified that Alturas Elementary School has some PWS type problems they will 
have to address. What is the cost to provide service to them? Not sure exactly what size 
meter will be needed but I guess a 2" meter. 

I will check with them to see if they will accept a connection. 

http://us.mg3 .mail.yahoo.com/neo/launch?.rand=ao74mp33ci952 
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Thank you, 

Charles 

The Department of Environmental Protection values your feedback as a customer. DEP Secretary 
Herschel T. Vinyard, Jr. is committed to continuously assessing and improving the level and quality 
of services provided to you. Please take a few minutes to comment on the quality of service you 
received. Simply click on this link to the DEP Customer Survev. Thank you in advance for 
completing the survey. 

From: Mike Smallridge [mailto:utilityconsuItant@yahoo.com] 
Sent: Wednesday, December 29, 2010 6:31 PM 
To: Coultas, Charles 
Subject: Alturas Utilities, Polk County 

Dear Charles, 

Using the list of names you emailed to me, My manager and I did a street by street, address 
by address inspection of the utility and found the following: 

Name and address with water line adjacent or across the street that can be connected: 

1. 
2. 
3. 
4. 
5. 
6. 
7. 
8. 
9. 

10. 
11. 
12. 
13. 
14. 

patrick frankenburger- 2205 oak dr. 
alturas elementry school- corner of central & 4th. 
fulton-cole-620 oak dr. 
josefa cavazos-2 190 oak dr. 
andrew talley- 2621 oak dr. 
john serdenski-2900 oak dr. 
r.e. stevens-3 150 central ave 
lou & Cindy stevens-3 150 central ave. 
martha underwood-3 102 central ave. 
ted serdynski-2 195 oak dr. 
jeanie tilley-3 190 central ave 
car1 hielscher-2555 oak ave 
current resident-2 120 hurley 
merlin or evelyn hielscher- 125 magnolia 

the following customers can be hooked up with a main line extension of 90' or less. 
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1. 
2. 
3. 
4. 
5. 
6 .  
7. 
8. 
9. 

10. 
11. 
12. 

Paul warren-2984 central 
nick mauel-2980 central 
allen voight-3070 central 
john byrd-2920 central 
Sara popoca-2890 central ave 
bonnie lynn-2940 central ave 
mike riddle-2970 central ave. 
tim griner-3 10 1 central ave. 
Scott barnes-2960 central 
ellie& brenda mole-2990 central ave. 
john allen smith-3040 central ave 
Wanda young-2905 central. 

I hope this helps. Of course I am a utility owner who is always willing to hook up new 
customers. please let me know how we can get this done. 

Mike Smallridge 

Alturas Utilities, LLC. 
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Subject:RE: Alturas School water supply. 
From: Coultas, Charles (Charles.Coultas@dep.state.fl.us) 
To: utilityconsultant@yahoo.com; 
Date: Fri, 17 Jun 2011 12:19:09 

That sounds good. I would suggest to have the contractor bid on removing all equipment and the a 
separate bid for removing everything except the carbon filter system ( the 2 large filter tanks and all 
piping that connects them). Depending on what they bid to remove the filter system we may have our 
filter contractor remove the system. The equipment we will not touch is the pressure tank chlorinator 
and any other system type equipment. 

Thanks 

CHarles 

From: Mike Smallridge [mailto:utilityconsuItant@yahoo.com] 
Sent: Friday, June 17, 201 1 11 :35 AM 
To: Coultas, Charles 
Subject: RE: Alturas School water supply. 

Hi Charles, I am having a contractor prepare a bid for you. As soon as I recieve the bid I will forward it 
to you. We just didnt know about the existing equipment that is currently on site. 

Should I have the contractor submit a bid for removal of the existing equipment on a seperate bid? 

let me know your preference. 

Mike Smallridge 

--- On Fri, 6/17/11, Coultas, Charles <Charles. Coultas@dep.state.flus> wrote: 

From: Coultas, Charles <Charles.Coultas@dep.state.fl.us> 
Subject: RE: Alturas School water supply. 
To: "'Mike Smallridge"' <utilityconsultant@yahoo.com> 

http://us.mg3 .mail.yahoo.com/neo/aunch?.rand=Oatvebfe2p6 1 b 
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Date: Friday, June 17,201 1, 8:55 AM 

Mr. Smallridge, 

We never received details about the connection. From what you sent I assume the County is 
paying for all costs for the connection. We can only pay if we have details and issue a 
Purchase order before the work is done. 

Our filter contractor can remove the existing filtration system after the connection is made or 
depending on details we may be able to hire someone else (Your contractor?) to remove it. 
Again, we can only assist if we know of what is going on before the work is done. 

Thank you, 

Charles 

The Department of Environmental Protection values your feedback as a customer. DEP Secretary Herschel T. 
Vinyard Jr. is committed to continuously assessing and improving the level and quality of services provided to you. 
Please take a few minutes to comment on the quality of service you received. Simply click on this link to the DEP 
Customer Survey. Thank you in advance for completing the survey. 

From: Mike Smallridge [mailto:utilityconsuItant@yahoo.com] 
Sent: Friday, June 17, 201 1 8:47 AM 
To: david.murphy@polk-fl.net 
Cc: Coultas, Charles 
Subject: Alturas School water supply. 

Hi David, 

1 meet with the contractor doing the work to hook up the alturas School and he wanted me to ask you if 
he needed to make removing the current equipment that is on site a part of his bid or do you guys handle 
that internally? we are unsure as to owns the equipment or if it is leased or rented? 

Please let me know when you can and the contractor can finish his bid. 

Thanks 

http://us.mg3 .mail.yahoo.com/neo/launch?.rand=Oatvebfe2p6 1 b 8/5/20 1 1 
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Mike Smallridge 

Alturas Utilities. 
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Subject:RE: Alturas School water supply. 
From: Coultas, Charles (Charles.Coultas@dep.state.fl.us) 
To: utilityconsultant@yahoo.com; 
Date: Fri, 17 Jun 2011 08:55:33 

Mr. Smallridge, 

We never received details about the connection. From what you sent I assume the County is paying for 
all costs for the connection. We can only pay if we have details and issue a Purchase order before the 
work is done. 

Our filter contractor can remove the existing filtration system after the connection is made or depending 
on details we may be able to hire someone else (Your contractor?) to remove it. Again, we can only 
assist if we know of what is going on before the work is done. 

Thank you, 

Charles 

The Department of Environmental Protection values your feedback as a customer. DEP Secretary Herschel T. 
Vinyard Jr. is committed to continuously assessing and improving the level and quality of services provided to 
you. Please take a few minutes to comment on the quality of service you received. Simply click on this link to the 
DEP Customer Survey. Thank you in advance for completing the survey. 

From: Mike Smallridge [mailto:utilityconsuItant@yahoo.com] 
Sent: Friday, June 17, 201 1 8:47 AM 
To: david.murphy@pol k-fl.net 
Cc: Coultas, Charles 
Subject: Alturas School water supply. 

Hi David, 

I meet with the contractor doing the work to hook up the alturas School and he wanted me to ask you if 
he needed to make removing the current equipment that is on site a part of his bid or do you guys handle 
that internally? we are unsure as to owns the equipment or if it is leased or rented? 

http://us.mg3 .mail.yahoo.com/neo/launch?.rand=ao74mp3 3 ci952 8/5/20 1 1 
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Please let me know when you can and the contractor can finish his bid. 

Thanks 

Mike Smallridge 

Alturas Utilities. 
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Subject:ALTURAS UTILITIES-MAIN EXTENSION FOR ALTURAS ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 
From: Gerald Garner (ditchdigger32@msn.com) 
To: utilityconsultant@yahoo.com; 
Date: Tue, 12 Jul2011 09:25:21 

MIKE 

COSTS TO CONSTRUCT WATER MAIN EXTENSION TO ALTURAS ELEMENTARY 
SCHOOL FROM INFORMATION AND MEETING WITH THE POLK COUNTY 
SCHOOL BOARD ONSITE. SHOULD YOU HAVE A QUESTION PLEASE 
GIVE LS A CALL. GERALD GARNER CUCO24575 
GARNER COMPLETESITE, INC. 863-581-1918 

http ://us .mg3 .mail .yahoo. com/neo/launch? .rand=Oatvebfe2~6 1 b 
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B l t  TO: 
MR. MIKE SMALbRIDGE 
ALTURAS UnLITIES I 
ALTURAS, FLORIDA 

GERPlLD GARNER PAGE 01/02 

BID DATE: GARNER COMPLETESITE, INC. 
P.O. BOX 889 PIPE 
AUBURNDALE. FLORIDA 33823-0889 

UNDERGROUND UTtUfy AhlU 
FXCAVATiON CONTRACTOR CGUC 024575 
GERALD H, GARNER, VICE PRESIDENT 

711 1/2011 581-1018 STATE C-ERTiFtED 

I 

, 
PROJECT: 
2" SERVICE EXTEN Of$ FOR A L T U M  
ELEMENTARY SCH 4, ALTUtlAS, FLORIDA 
SERVICE UNDER 'T1ING POLK COUNTY 
PAVED STREET AT +dlJRAS ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 
WITH ALL UNE TAP& AVJD CONNECTIONS AND 
ISOUlTfON 

4 
MOBILIZATION I 

TRAFFIC MAINTENANCE 1 

UTILITY LOCATE I 

DIRECTIONAL BORE WATIfR LINE UNDER EXISTING 
PAVED R O N  
SERVICE VALVES, TEES 'ND APPURTENANCES 
2" BACKFLOW PREVENT4 
CONCRETE PAD WITH 60~lARDS 
CONNECT TO EXISTING WTERLINES INCL. FITTINGS 
TAP EXISTtNG WATER WITH 2" 
2" WATER SERVICE PIPINP WITH LOCATOR WIRE 
METER ASSEMBLY (USE FXIS'TING METER) 
GRASSING IN FRONT OF gCyOOL 
CAP EXlSTING WATER I 

BACTERIOLOGICAL$ 1 

I 

PRESSURE TEST FOR &ATERUNE 

1 

1 is 
.I LS 
1 is 
1 is 

1 is 
1 EA 
1 EA 
1 E A  
I LS 
1 tS 
l € A  
1 LS 
1 LS 
I LS 
1 LS 

ALL ITEMS TO CONSTRUCT COMPLETE 

SCHOOL SUBTOTAL 

I 
I INSTALLATION OF WATER 1lNE TO $ 10,801 .OO 
I 

REMOVE EXISTING FIL+RS THAT ARE NOT 
OPERATING AND IN NE@D OF EXPENSIVE 

TRANSPoRTATlON EXPENSE 1 LS $ 3,495 00 $ 3,495.00 
REPAIR, RISMANTEL PIYES AND ADDITIONAL 

AMOUNT FOR TANK REMOVAL $ 3,495.00 
PRICE GOOQ 30 DAYS FROM 40 bAE ABOVE 

NOT INCLUDED. TOTAL $ 14,296.00 

UTILITY CONFLICTS, CERTIFI4 MBUILTS, RETAINAGE, TRENCH BOX, 
ELECTRICAL, EROSION CONTF$OL, CLEARING, GRUBBING, 
CERTIFIED ASBUILT$, SOD, I 
PAVEMEW REMOVAL OR RE@GEMENT. tRRlGATlON 

SLOPE PAVING, CONSrtlUCTIC$N WATER 8 METER FEES 

LF IT IS AWARDED THE JOB. C3jP I 15 NOT RESPONSIBLE FOR ANY UTIUTES 
NOT LOCATED BY SUNSHINE LPATES SERVICE OR MADE KNOWN TO 
G C I BY M E  "ASBUILT DWdE(G$" OR FOR I'TEMS NOT SPECIFICALLY 
ITEMIZED ON THE ABOVE DES RIF?ION SCHEDULE. 

I 
PERMIT FEES, 

G c I WILL REQUIRE AN A P P R Q ~  FOR GDNSTRUCTION SET OF PLANS 

p 
I 

I. 



W rn 
Q a 

m -  
rl 

r- 
m 
.. 

FROM: 
GARNER COMPLETESITE, INC. 

PIP€ DATE: 7/f 11201 1 
P.0,  BOX889 

AUBURNDAL€, FLORIDA 33823-0889 

FAX PHONE #: 81 3-4f2-3444 
TO: AJTN: 
MR MIKE SMALLRIDGE 
ALTU RAS UTI LfTl ES 

PAGES 1N FAX, INCLUDING COVER 

RE: 
ALTURAS ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 
WATER MAIN EXTENTION AND 
FILTER REMOVAL 

CALL WITH ANY QUESTIONS- I WILL BE OUT UNTIL 
AROUND 7 0:OO AM AT DR'S. 

2 

. . . .  .... 

.- 

... ... _. 
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Subject:RE: ALTURAS UTILITIES-MAIN EXTENSION FOR ALTURAS ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 
From: Coultas, Charles (Charles.Coultas@dep.state.fl.us) 
To: utilityconsultant@yahoo. com; 
Date: Wed, 13 Jul2011 13:11:37 

Hello Mike, 

The attached shows a total cost but it also lists things that are not included. It looks like the work 
estimate is for the waterline work and the GAC tank removal. 

We need an estimate that shows all costs required for the complete new water service. We would also 
like to see the cost breakdown for the work listed. 

Thank you, 

Charles 

The Department of Environmental Protection values your feedback as a customer. DEP Secretary Herschel T. 
Vinyard Jr. is committed to continuously assessing and improving the level and quality of services provided to 
you. Please take a few minutes to comment on the quality of service you received. Simply click on this link to the 
DEP Customer Survev. Thank you in advance for completing the survey. 

From: Mike Smallridge [mailto:utilityconsultant@yahoo.com] 
Sent: Wednesday, July 13,201 1 11 5 3  AM 
To: Coultas, Charles 
Subject: Fw: ALTURAS UTILITIES-MAIN EXTENSION FOR ALTURAS ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 

Charles, we all meet including two people f'rom the Polk County School Board. They are excited about 
hooking up as the current filters are not working. Since school starts back again August 2nd, when could 
you give me the green light? 

----- Forwarded Message ----- 
From: Gerald Garner <ditchdigger32@msn.com> 
To: Mike Smallridge <utilityconsultant@yahoo.com> 
Sent: Tuesday, July 12,201 1 9:25 AM 
Subject: ALTURAS UTILITIES-MAIN EXTENSION FOR ALTURAS ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 

http ://us .mg3 .mail .yahoo. codneo  /launch? .rand=Oatvebfe2p6 1 b 8/5/2011 
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MIKE 

COSTS TO CONSTRUCT WATER MAIN EXTENSION TO ALTURAS ELEMENTARY 
SCHOOL FROM INFORMATION AND MEETING WITH THE POLK COUNTY 
SCHOOL BOARD ONSITE. SHOULD YOU HAVE A QUESTION PLEASE 
GIVE US A CALL. GERALD GARNER CUCO24575 
GARNER COMPLETESITE, INC. 863-581-1918 
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