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1. From Division / Staff: IDivision Of Regulatory AnalysislToni Earnhart 'lCU 
v 

2.0PR: Toni Earnhart, RAD 

3. OCR: GCO 

4. Suggested Docket Title: Reguest for cancellation of Certificate of Authority Nos. 8705 and 8706 by FL-CLEC 
LLC, effective 12/9/2011. 

5. Program/Module/Submodule Assignment: 8-1.F 

6. Suggested Docket Mail List. 

a. Provide NAMES/ACRONYMS, if registered company. 0 Provided as an Attachment 

Company Code, 
if applicable: 

TA082 

Parties 
(include address, if different from MCD): Representatives (name and address): 

TX948 

b. Provide COMPLETE NAME AND ADDRESS for all others. (match representatives to companies) 

Company Code, Interested persons, if any, 
if applicable: (include address, if different from MCD): Representatives (name and address): 

7. Check one: IZl Supporting Documentation Attached 0 To be provided with Recommendation 

Comments: Documentation Attached 
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FL-CLEC LLC 	 Tel 724 416-2000 

2000 Corporate Dri\le 	 Fax 724416-2353 

Canonsburg, PA 15317 	 www.crowncastle.com 
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DIVISION OFDecember 7, 2011 REGULATORY GOHPLlAHCE 

VIA UPS 

Florida Public Service Commission 
2540 Shumard Oak Blvd. 
Tallahassee, FL 32399-0850 
Attn: Beth Salak, Director Regulatory Analysis 
850.413.6770 

RE: 	 FL - CLEC LLC 
Voluntary Cancellation of Authority to Provide Alternative Access Vendor 
Service and Competitive Local Exchange Telecommunications Service 
within the State of Florida 

Dear Ms. Salak: 

On behalf ofFL - CLEC LLC (the "Company"), I hereby respectfully request that the 
Company's registration as an Alternative Access Vendor pursuant to Docket No. 
070659-T A and Company's registration to provide Competitive Local Exchange 
Telecommunications Services pursuant to Docket No. 070658-TX, both granted on 
January 4, 2008, be cancelled effective December 31, 2011. 

The Company asserts that it does not have any customers whose service would be 
impacted by the cancellation of either authority. 

The Company further asserts that it has filed and paid its 2011 Regulatory Assessment 
Fee Return for T A082 and TX948, a copy of which is enclosed herewith. 

In addition, I have also enclosed an extra copy of this letter to be date stamped and 
returned to me in the enclosed, self-addressed, postage prepaid envelope. 

Please contact me at 724.416.2239 or via email atmichelle.salisburvrlilcrowncastle.com 	 ':t: 
Cl:if you have any questions or need any additional information. 	 II 
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Toni Earnhart 

From: Raquel Tully 

Sent: Friday, December 09, 2011 1 :53 PM 

To: Toni Earnhart 

Subject: RE: FL - CLEC LLC T A082 and TX948 

That's fine, just got the check and thanks 

From: Toni Earnhart 
Sent: Friday, December 09, 20111:52 PM 
To: Raquel Tully 
Subject: RE: FL - CLEC LLC TA082 and TX948 

The company has requested a 2011 Voluntary Cancellation effective 12/9/11 for FL - CLEC LLC. 

I haven't had a chance to open the docket yet because the request just came in today. 

Please apply TA082 $600 to the 2011 RAF and TX948 to the 2011 RAF. 

From: Raquel Tully 
Sent: Friday, December 09, 20111:38 PM 
To: Toni Earnhart 
Subject: 

Good Afternoon, just received a $1200.00 check for TA082 and TX948, how do you want me to deposit it 

12/12/2011 



