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TO AVOID PENALTY AND INTEREST CHARGES, THE REGULATORY ASSESSMENT FEE RETURN MUST BE FILED ON OR BEFORE 01/30/2013

Local Telephone Service Provider Regulatory Assessment Fee Return

Florida Public Service Commission FOR PSC USE ONLY

STATUS: (See Filing Instructlons on Back of Form) (Checl# S @ /
—_Actual Retum TS196-12-0-R s _Lo( Y 2 O 603
— Estimated Return LMG Enterprises, LLC oo:;gg :
— Amended Retum 2636 S.E. 13th Court \ S

Pompano Beach, FI. 33062-7213 Hs 30. 00
PERIOD COVERED: ngE DEPOSIT ' “3’3?8? :
01/01/2012 TO 12/31/2012 s_(0.C )O I

A

MAR 1120133 11

f\/ul)/(

Postmark Date 0?0?8' ’§

Initials of Preparer 21
YUL Please Complete Below If Official Mailing Address Has Changed .
(Name of Company) (Address) (City/State) (Zip)
TOTAL
LINE FLORIDA GROSS INTRASTATE
NO. OPERATING REVENUE REVENUE
L. Local Service Revenues $ —~g) — s ___—Oo—
2. Network Access Revenues el o e -0 —
3. Long Distance Network Services Revenues ) — =P
4, Miscellaneous Revenues —_ - —)
5. TOTAL REVENUES s —O— s —O—
LESS: Amounts Paid to Other Telecommunications Companies( —_
7. NET INTRASTATE OPERATING REVENUE for Regulatory Assessment Fee Calculation (Line S less Line 6) $ — e
8. Regulatory Assessment Fee Due (Multiply Line 7 by 0.0016. If more than $600, enter amount. If less, enter $600.)® ——
9. Penalty for Late Payment (see “3. Failure to File by Due Date” on back) O
10. Interest for Late Payment (see “3. Failure to File by Due Date” on back) — O
11. Extension Payment Fee (see “4. Extension “ on back) o

12.

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE (Add lines 8 through 11)

(1) These amounts must be jntrastate only and must be verifiable (see "2. Fees" on back).
(2) Regardless of the gross operating revenue of 8 company, a minimum annual regulatory assessment fee of $600 shall be
imposed as provided in Section 364.336, Florida Statutes.

B

.

$ —t D) e

I, the undersigned owner/officer of the above-named company, have read the foregoing and declare that to the best of my knowledge and belief

the above informatio:
false statement i
second de

ignature of Company Dfficial)
SRAZIER 4. f;//x/zzs

{Preparer of Form - Please Print Name)

PSC/RAD 159 (12/11)
Rule 25-4.0161, F.AC.

s’a true and correct statement. I am aware that pursuant to Section 837.06, Florida Statutes, whoever knowingly makes a
with the intent to mislead a public servant in the performance of his official duty shall be guilty of a misdemeanor of the

(Title)
Telephone Number -

FELNo._ G B-2594398

&aé_éléé;/\’:’

Fax Number ()




Toni Earnhart

From: Bob Casey

Sent: Wednesday, March 13, 2013 2:14 PM
To: Toni Earnhart

Subject: FW: New filing in undocketed matter

From: Filings Clerk

Sent: Wednesday, March 13, 2013 2:14 PM

To: Terri Fleming; Carolyn Craig; Jeff Bates; Beth Salak; Bob Casey; Mark Long
Subject: New filing in undocketed matter

DOCUMENT DESCRIPTION = AlT/Fiscal - $636 payment record from LMG Enterprises, LLC for 2012 RAFs; Dep
311 dated 3/11/13; with attached handwritten note dated 2/28/13, requesting
cancellation of TS196.

DOCUMENT PATH =
file://L.\PSC\LIBRARY\FILINGS\13101289-13

Document ID = 01289-13
Document Filed 03/13/13

The filing described above is now available in PDF format.

To access it, click on the DOCUMENT PATH link. This will pop up a Windows Explorer window. You will see the PDF
(Adobe Acrobat) version; you will also see other versions if they exist. Double-click on the preferred version and the
document will open.

If you need to cut/paste/search in the document and find you can't, try later when the reformatted version is available. (For
more information, see PDF Tips on the How To menu.)

This is an automatically generated e-mail; no response/reply is hecessary.




Toni Earnhart

From: Toni Earnhart

Sent: Monday, February 25, 2013 1:53 PM
To: David Brown

Cc: Raquel Tully

Subject: RE: LMG Enterpises TS196
David/Raquel,

| just spoke with LMG Enterprises 75196 and they will be sending $636 2012 RAF with P&l in a check this week.
Please let me know when it arrives so | can finalize cancelling the certificate.

Thank you,

Toni Joy Earnhart, Regulatory Analyst
Florida Public Service Commission
Office of Telecommunications

2540 Shumard QOak Blvd.

Tallahassee, FL 32399

Phone 850-413-6532

Fax 850-413-6533

From: David Brown

Sent: Monday, February 25, 2013 1:07 PM
To: Toni Earnhart

Subject:

FYL....




TO AVOIP PENALTY AND INTEREST CHARGES, THE REGULATORY ASSESSMENT FEE RETURN MUST BE FILED ON OR BEFORE 01/30/2012
Interim Local Telephone Service Provider Regulatory Assessment Fee Return
7

Used for Calendgr Year 2011 Only -
o
Florida Public Service Commission FOR PSC USE ONLY
R Check #
STATUS: . See Instructions on Back of Ferm 50
—__Acmal Rewn TS196-11-0-R $_L00 oo 06-03-001
.. Estimated Return . |LMG Enterprises, LL.C 003001
—— Amended Retum " [2636 S.E. 13th Court DATE  DEPCAIT s ___ _  E
PERIOD COVERE Pompano Beach, FL. 33062-7213 s P 06-03-001
D: 1 0040
01/01/2011 TO 12/31/2011' MARO6 2012232 s 1 !
Postmark Date -3 1~1d .
M Initials of Preparer
i Rlease Complete Below If Official Mailing Address Has Changed

(Name of Company)’ (Address) (City/State) (Zip)
LINE SR FLORIDA GROSS INTRASTATE
NO. R ; OPERATING REVENUE REVENUE
L Local Service Revenuces $ —_— — $ —_— -
2. Network Access Revenues —> — —_——
3. LongDistance Network Scrvices Revenues — — —_—
4, Miscellaneous Revenues —_—0 o
5. TOTAL REVENUES s, — O — s —o -
6. LESS: Amounts Paid to Other Tel ications Companics™ 2
7. NET INTRASTATE OPERATING REVENUE for Regulatory Asscssment Fee Calculation (Line 5 less Line 6) $ —_ —
8. Regulatory Assessment Fee Due (Multiply Line 7 by 0.0018. 1f more than $600, enter amount. If less, enter $600.)” T p—
9. Penalty for Late Payment (see “3. Failure to File by Due Date” on back) —)
10. Interest for Late Payment (see “3. Failure to File by Duc Date™ on back) —
1l Extension Payment Fee (see “4. Extension “ on back) — D
12. TOTAL AMOUNT DUE (Add lincs 8 through 11) S_EOrp. =
(1) These amounts must be jnirastate oply and must be verifiable (see "2. Fees” on back).
(2) Regardless of the gross operating r of a npany, a mini annual regulatory fee of $600 shall be

imposed as provided in Section 364.336, Florida Statutes.

1, the undersigned owner/officer of the above-named company, have read the foregoing and declare that to the best of my knowledge and belief

14(65/ Le/T

(Title) )
dononte (B2 TS, v o)
FELNo. G865 R43XE

PSC/RAD 160 (12/11)
Rule 25-4.0161, FAC.
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3518 North SR 32
Kamas, Utah. 84036
Tel: (435) 783-2802
Fax :( 435) 783-2803
Cell: (754) 264-3733

LM.G. Enterprises, L.L.C.

February 27, 2012

Florida Public Service Commission
2540 Shumard Oak Bivd.
Tallahassee, FL. 32399

Aun: Figcal Services,

Re: Request for cancellation of TS 196-11-0-D

Since we have never activated or used this certificate we request a cancellation of TS 196-11-0-D
Please note our mailing address change.

LMG Entetprises, LLC

3518 North SR 32
Kamas, Utah. 84036

Sincerely;

/7 7 Frazitr L. Gaines
S/ - President.




COMPANY IDENTIFICATION
Printed on 03/14/2013 at 14:14:45 by TJE

Complete Name: IMG Enterprises, LLC

Mailing Name: IMG Enterprises, LLC
Company Code: TS196 FEID Number: 58-2584328

COMPANY INFORMATION

Address Line 1l: 2636 S.E. 13th Court

Address Line 2:

City: Pompano Beach State: FL Zip Code: 33062-7213
Reg. Date: 10/28/2002 Inactive Date:

Transfered To:

Trans. From:

Certificate 1: 8218 Certificate 2:
Corporate Type: Limited Partnership
Service 1l: STS - Shared Tenant Service

Service 2:

Service 3:

Service 4:

Class (WAW):

Phone Count:

County 1: County 2:
County 3: County 4:
Bankruptcy: No




