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TELCENTRAL INC.
13488 S. SOUTHPOINT AVE
FLORAL CITY, FL 34436

4/24/2015 Certified No.70131710000193016819

Bob Casey and Beth W. Salak
Florida Public Service Commission
2540 Shumard Oak Blvd
Tallahassee, FL. 32399-0850

Dear Bob Casey and Beth W. Salak

Effective immediately Telcentral Inc requests to cancel its pay telephone certificate #
%f’ﬁg Telcentral Inc is no longer an active corporation as we have gone out of business.
2NG 2D

I am sending this request via email to beasey(@psc.state.fl.us , bsalak@psc.state.fl.us
and also certified U.S. Postal Service.

Thank you

Robert Holmlund



Sakina Deas

From: , Beth Salak

Sent: ‘ Thursday, April 23, 2015 4:48 PM

To: Sakina Deas; Bob Casey

Subject: FW: Cancel Telcentral #3618 payphone certificate

We can put this in the docket to confirm that he agrees.

From: Robert H [mailto:telcentral777 @gmail.com]

Sent: Thursday, April 23, 2015 4:19 PM

To: Beth Salak '
Subject: Re: Cancel Telcentral #3618 payphone certificate

Yes! That sounds correct for Telcentral Inc.
Thanks Robert Holmlund

On Thu, Apr 23, 2015 at 2:42 PM, Beth Salak <BSalak@psc.state.fl.us> wrote:

Mr. Holdrum,

We will begin processing your cancellation, but our records indicate that your certificate number is 3718 and
that is the certificate we will be cancelling. If you disagree with the certificate number our records reflect, please let me
know.

Sincerely,

Beth Salak

From: Robert H [mailto:telcentral777@gmail.com]
Sent: Thursday, April 23, 2015 9:26 AM

To: Bob Casey

Cc: Beth Salak

Subject: Cancel Telcentral #3618 payphone certificate

4/24/15



Dear Bob Casey and Beth Salak

Enclosed is a letter to cancel Telcentral #3618 payphone certificate. Telcentral is no longer an active
corporation and has gone out of business.

Thank you

Robert Holmlund
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Service: |PAT onfidential [ Raf Form Withdrawn [} Audited
Current RAF Status: RAF period payment with satisfy all the fee end Collection Collection Date: o : Collection Withdrawn
Raf Transactions: v [ RAF Form Received % Actual T Estimated Us;r [
Operating Revenue: i1,295.96 mended Return " Don't calculate Penalty ¥ Don't calculate Interest
Gross Interstate Revenue: T ) RAF Account Satisfied
3
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)
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