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1. From Division / Staff: Office Of Telecommunications/C. Williams .~ 4~ %

2. OPR: C. Williams

3. OCR:

4. Suggested Docket Title: | Request for Cancellation of CLEC Certificate No. 5257 by BudgeTel Systems, Inc.,
effective May 3, 2016.

5. Program/Module/Submodule Assignment:

6. Suggested Docket Mailing List
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Curtis Williams

S T AR I s T
To: e

Cc: Greg Fogleman; Toni Earnhart

Subject: RE: BudgeTel Systems Inc.'s Request to Cancel Certificate No. 5257

Mr. Schlenger,

Based on your email below, | will open a docket to cancel BudgeTel Systems, Inc.’s (TX126) telecommunications
company certificate.

As we discussed today, Ms. Toni Earnhart will send you a Regulatory Assessment Fee (RAF) Form to include with your
2016 RAF payment.

Once we receive your 2016 RAF payment, we can quickly proceed with cancelling your certificate and closing the docket.
Please let me know if you have questions or need additional information.

Thank You.

Curtis J. Williams

Public Utility Analyst

Office of Telecommunications
Florida Public Service Commission
2540 Shumard Oak Boulevard
Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0850
Office: (850) 413-6924

Fax: (850) 413-6925

Email: cjwillia@psc.state.fl.us

From: e [mailto:hschlenger@aol.com]

Sent: Tuesday, May 03, 2016 4:18 PM

To: Curtis Williams

Subject: Re: BudgeTel Systems Inc.'s Request to Cancel Certificate No. 5257

Dear Mr. Williams. This is our 2nd notice. We have cancelled our BudgeTel Systems Inc. Certificate Number 5257. We
will pay the 2016 Regulatory Assessment Fee when due. Thank you. HSchlenger@aol.com

----- Original Message-----

From: Curtis Williams <CJWillia@PSC.STATE.FL.US>

To: e (hschlenger@aol.com) <hschlenger@aol.com>

Cc: Greg Fogleman <GFoglema@PSC.STATE FL.US>

Sent: Fri, Apr 29, 2016 3:33 pm

Subject: BudgeTel Systems Inc.'s Request to Cancel Certificate No. 5257

Mr. Schlenger,



Per our phone conversation, BudgeTel Systems, Inc. would like to cancel its Certificate No. 5257. To move forward with
your request, you will need to pay BudgeTel Systems, Inc.’s 2016 Regulatory Assessment Fees.

Please provide confirmation by responding to this email that you would like to cancel BudgeTel System’s certificate.

" Also, please provide the date you plan to pay the 2016 Regulatory Assessment Fees due.

Please let me know if you have any questions.

Thank You.

Curtis J. Williams

Public Utility Analyst

Office of Telecommunications
Florida Public Service Commission
2540 Shumard Oak Boulevard
Tallahassee, Florida 32399-0850
Office: (850) 413-6924

Fax: (850) 413-6925

Email: cjwillia@psc.state.fl.us




TG AVOID PENALTY AND INTEREST CHARGES, THE REGULATORY ASSESSMENT FEE RETURN MURT BE FILED ON OR BEFORE 212016
Locs! Telephone Service Provider Regulatory Assessment Fee Return

Florida Public Service Commission FOR PSC USE ONLY .
Check # / /7!?‘ (f';) Al

STATUS: (See Filing Tustructions on Back of Form)

i Actunl Return TX126-16-T-0-R $ ,LLQPQ;“ _____ 06-03-001
Estimated Return BudgcTcl Systems, Inc. 003001
Amended Retum 324 S.E. 10th Street, Suite 404 $ e E

Dania Beach, b"lﬁ?@" )04 %«f’i‘* S P 06-03-00!

PERIOD COVERED: B 2 004011

1/172016 TO 124312016 > S

MAT 19 2018697
Posunark DmcS —JQ Z.é
Initials of Preparer e

Please Complete Below It Offieial Maiting Address Has Changed

Bu D el et -G;, TEMS. /e Jxy L& 0l Oy # Sy Chney &«m( p/:l’ 3300
(Name of Company} {Address) (Chy'State) (Zip)
TOTAL
LINE FLORIDA GROSS INTRASTATE
NO. OPERATING REVENUE REVENUE
1. Loeal Service Revenues 5 /«, ?2-, Lo $ [GL. &0
2, Newwork Access Revenues =~ O -
3. Long Distance Network Services Revenues —
4, Miscellancous Revenues o~
5, TOTAL REVENUES S /9YL.bo $ [§21.6c
0, LESS: Amounts Paid o Other Telecommunications Companies''? / éZ 59
7. NET INTRASTATE OPERATING REVENUE for Repulatory. Assessment Fee Caleutation (Line § less Line 6) s 3 0,0/
£
8. Regulatory Asscssment Fee Due (Multiply Line 7by 0.0016. [f more than $600, enter amount. [f less, enter $600.)° boo. c0
|
| 9. Penalty for Late Payment (see 3. Failure o File by Due Date™ on back)
0. Interest for Late Payment (see 3. Failur¢ to File by Due Date™ on back)
. Extension Payment Fee (see “4. Extension ™ on back)
12. TOTAL AMOUNT DUE (Add fines & through 1) s &b& O,Q
%

(1) These amounts must be intrastate ouly and must be verifiable (see 2. Fees" on back).
” {2) Regardless of the gross operating revenuc of & company, a winimum annual regulatory assessment fee of 5600 shall be
imposed as provided in Scction 364,336, Florida Statutes.

1. the undersigned owner/officer of the above-named company, have read the foregoing and declare that to the best of my knowledge and beliel
the above information is a wue and correet statement, 1 am aware that pussuant o Section 837.06, Florida Statites, whoever knowingly makes a
false statement in writing with the intent (o mistead a public servant in the performance of his official duty shall be guilty of a misdemeaner of the
second degree.

2 7 P .
4 At et iﬁ’u,. F s, 57/(””""’/6
(Signature of Corfipany Official) {Tile) 7 (Date)

Telephone Number  ( ?:)—L’/" FAL- ¢ 3§ ¥Viax Number ()

{Preparer of Form - Please Print Nanie)

FELNo. % S§-0739¢4

PSC/TEL 159(12/1 1)
Rule 25-4.0161, F.A.C.
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5/19/2016 webapps/mcd/raflist.aspx?PageName=searchresultdetail&C ompany|D=2303&FEIDNUM=65-0786919&U Code=TX126&UTILITYID=2941
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TaxID: 650786319 Complete Name: BudaeTel Systems, Inc, Address: 324 SE 10th Street Suite 404 Dania Beach FL 33004-5229 USA Contact: Eresigent W 8, Schignger (305) 899-1155 Faue, (554) 922:9357 Bankrupicy Start Oate:  Bankruptcy Drop Date:  Active:
| CreatBy: NGHANT CreatDate: L1/11/1957 ModifyBy: NGEANT ModifyDate: §/002014 L4746 PM

Master Commission DIRECTORY Welcome, CIWILLIA!

Utihty Code TX126 Utility Mame. BudgeTel Systems. Inc. Active:
Utility Code To: Utility Code From Unregulated Operation Date Corptype Type:  Compeeation * Class Type *  NGRANT created at 1997.11-11 000000 MGRANT modified at 2015-02-27 1004300
Total: 20 RAF Droguments
cix $16259 000160000 560000  O0U3W2017  $0.00 50.00 $0.00 $600.00 . - $0.00 $0.00 5000
2 Bud v 3 CLX §119.87 0.00160000  $600.00  0201/2016  $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $600.00 $600.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
3  BudgeTel Systems, Inc. 0U02014-12/31/2014 CLx §568.58 0.00160000  $600.00 032015 $0.00 $0.00 50.00 $600.00 $600.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
4 BudgeTel Systems, Inc. ONV0U2013-12/3112013 cLx $1.811.00 000160000  $600.00 032014 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $600.00 $600.00 $0.00 $0.00 30.00 $0.00
5 BudgeTel Systems, Inc. ovovMIZINIM2 X $804,T1 0.00160000  $600.00 03NN $0.00 50.00 $0.00 $600.00 $600.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
& BudgeTel Systems, |nc. OUOY2011-12312011 (=54 $2,703.00 000180000  $500.00 0132012 S0.00 $0.00 $0.00 SE00.00 $600.00 50.00 $0.00 50,00 50,00
7 BudgeTel Systems, Inc. QU003 1200 cx 54.458.00 000200000  $600.00 0132011 §0.00 $0.00 50.00 $600.00 $600.00 50.00 $0.00 50.00 $0.00
B BudgeTel Systems, Inc. 01012009-12131/2008 CLX $4.301.00 000200000  $500.00 0HOVR0  $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $E00.00 $600.00 $0.00 $0.00 50.00 50.00
9 BudgeTel Systems. Inc. 01/01/2008-12/31/2008 (=54 $3,821.00 000200000  $500.00  OV30M2008  $0.00 50,00 $0.00 $600.00 $600,00 50,00 $0.00 $0.00 50.00
10 BudgeTel Systems. inc, 01012007-12/31/2007 o $4.856.06 000200000 §60000  OU3O2008  $0.00 50.00 50.00 $600.00 $600,00 $0.00 $0.00 50,00 $0.00
| 11 BudgaTel Systems, Inc. OAAD2006-12731/ 2006 (=% 3 $0.00 0.00200000  $50.00 0132007 $12.50 $3.00 $0.00 $65.50 $65.50 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
| 12 BudgeTel Systems, Inc. 01020051 2/31/2005 [=E3 $4,231.00 000200000  $50.00 QU3I2006  $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $50.00 $50.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
| 13 BudgeTel Systems, Inc. VDT 2004-12/31/2004 (=53 $3,8901.00 0.00150000  §50.00 013N2005  $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $50.00 55000 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
| 14 BudgeTel Systems. Inc. 01/0%/2003-12/31/2003 (=54 $3.660.00 000150000  $50.00 013IN2004  50.00 $0.00 $0.00 550,00 $50.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
15 BudgeTel Systems, Inc. 01/01/2002-12131/2002 CLX $3.038.00 000150000  $50.00 OVIN2003  $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 §50.00 §50.00 $0.00 §0.00 50.00 $0.00
16 BudgeTel Systems, Inc. 0101 2001-1273 172001 CLx $2,120.10  0.00150000  $50.00 0VIN2002  $50.00 §0.00 §0.00 $50.00 $50.00 $0.00 50,00 50.00 $0.00
17 BudgaTel Systems, inc, D012000-12/31/2000 CLX $1.754.94  0.00150000  $50.00 013072001 $0.00 $0.00 50.00 $50.00 $50.00 $0.00 50.00 $0.00 $0.00
18 BudgeTel Systems, Inc. 01/01/1998-12/31/1999 CLX $4,554.41 000150000  $50.00 01312000 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 §50.00 $50.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
19 BudgeTel Systems, Inc. 0101/ 1988-12131/1998 CLX §1.101.24  0.00150000  $50.00 02011998 $0.00 $0.00 §0.00 §50.00 $50.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
20 BudgeiTel Systems, Inc. 00 ST 2311997 CLx $0.00 0.00150000  $50.00 030198 $0.00 £0.00 $0.00 $50.00 $50.00 50.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

http://webapps/mcd/raflist aspx?PageName=searchresultdetail &CompanyID=2303&F EIDNUM=65-0786919&U Code=TX126&UTILITYID=2941
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