
STATE OF FLORIDA 
DEPARTME IT OF Fl 'ANCIAL SER\'lCES 

APPLICATION FOR REFlfND 

FILED 2/6/2019 
DOCUMENT NO. 00641-2019 
FPSC- COMMISSION CLERK 

Section 2 15.26, Florida Statutes, states in part: "Applications for refunds as provided in this section shall be 

fil ed with the Chief Financial Officer, except as otherwise provided herein, within 3 years after the right to such 

refund shall have accrued else such right shall be barred." Three years is generally interpreted as meaning 

three years from the date of payment into the State treasury. The Chief Financial Officer has delegated the 

authority to accept applications for refund to the unit of State government, which initially collected the money. 

************************************************************************************************ 

Pursuant to the provisions of Rule 691-44.020, Florida Administrative Code, and Section 215.26, Florida 

Statutes, or Section •, Florida Statutes, I hereby apply for a refund of moneys I paid into the State 

treasury, which are subject to refund. The following information is submitted to substantiate the claim. 

Name: w~s+ 4M!1/ Wet)hw"~'ILtC FEIN orSSNoJ7- 3 55 J5? 7 
Address: 5 '1// [rluble_ Cr,~J:. f2d 

(/(,#/ /brf- t(_l '(_h~y I El- $' 'f' ~ s- 2._ • 

Amount: .W 5lJD Date Paid ---------------------
Reason for Claim: ~lUx· pa'Jme of. J -{i ),. n7 f...:t~ 

CERTIFIED TRUE AND CORRECT l:k'~'L A_/'J 
S•gnaturen...~ ---~r 

~ 

* Must be completed if authority is other than Section 215.26, Florida Statutes. t;:~ 

**************************************************************************************
***•··~· 

(FOR AGENCY USE ONLY) ~J -rt 
'"":\ F"1"1 

c:o 
Agency recommends approval of the above claim and submits the following information to substantiate the r 

claim: Amount of recommended refund$ · •: : 0"1 

• ) ;t:Jo 

The amount requested above was originally deposited into the State treasury as a part of the fund s ~ositecDin 

State Treasurer's Receipt No. dated ~ 

NAMEOFACCOUNT: __________________________________________________ -8~--

~ ACCOUNTCODE 

I I I I I I I I I 

Statutory Authority for Collection: ___________________________________________________ _ 

It is requested that payment be made from the following accou nt: 

NAME OF ACCOUNT: ____________________________________________________ __ 

- ACCOUNTCODE -

I lLUUUJJJ I I I I I I I I I I I I I I I I I I i I 

Agency 

DFS-AA-4 
Rev. 0207 

CERTIFIED TRUE AND CORRECT this __ day of _______________ ___ _ 

Signature of Authorized Person 

Title 



Mike Smallridge 

From: 
Sent: 
To: 
Subject: 

Mr. Smallridge, 

Adam Teitzman [ATEITZMA@psc.state.fl.us] 
Tuesday, January 29, 2019 8:30AM 
'mike@fus111c.com' 
RE: Docket No. 20180202-SU 

I have been notified by our fiscal department that because you filed a W-9 last year and it is still in the system, you will 

not be requtred to do so agatn. Accordingly, all you will need to dots complete the DFS-AA-4 Application for Refund and 

mail it to the Commisston. 

Sincerely, 

Adam J. ') citzman 
Commission Clerk 

Florida Pubhc Service Commission 

2540 Shumard Oak Boulevard 

Tallahassee, Florida 32399 

Adam Teitzman@psc.state.fl.us 
850.413.6826 

From: Adam Teitzman 
Sent: Monday, January 28, 2019 5:29PM 
To: 'mike@fus111c.com' 
Cc: Sharon Allbritton 
Subject: Docket No. 20180202-SU 

Mr. Smallridge, 
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Attached please find a letter that was filed today in Docket No. 20180202-SU regarding a partial refund of your filing fee. 

Regards, 

Adam J. Tcitzman 
Commission Clerk 

Florida Public Service Commission 

2540 Shumard Oak Boulevard 

Tallahassee, Florida 32399 

Adam.Teitzman@psc.state.fl.us 
850.413.6826 
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