FILED 2/14/2020
DOCUMENT NO. 00907-2020
FPSC - COMMISSION CLERK

Public Service Commission

CAPITAL CIRCLE OFFICE CENTER ® 2540 SHUMARD OAK BOULEVARD
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32399-0850

-M-E-M-0-R-A-N-D-U-M-
DATE: February 14, 2020
TO: Adam J. Teitzman, Commission Clerk, Office of Commission Clerk
FROM: Todd M. Brown, Public Utilities Supervisor, Division of Accounting & Finance%‘
RE: Docket No. 20140217-WU — Application for staff-assisted rate case in Sumter

County by Cedar Acres, Inc.

Please place the attached documents in the above-referenced docket. The documents include an
email sent to Cedar Acres, Inc. by staff on August 29, 2019, and the utility’s responses on
September 6 and 11, 2019. The documents relate to the status of meter replacements established
by the Commission in Order No. PSC-2015-0535-PAA-WU.

Thank you.
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Todd Brown ,

From: Todd Brown

Sent: Thursday, August 29, 2019 10:21 AM

To: 'cedaracresinc@gmail.com'’; ‘simonsjsr@aol.com’; 'davidjsimons@aol.com’
Cc: Charles Murphy o

Subject: Cedar Acres Meter Replacements

Good morning. Just wanted to follow-up on the status of Cedar Acres’ meter replacements. As of your escrow
reimbursement request dated February 8, 2019, you indicated that 170 meters had been replaced.

1. Have any additional meters been replaced since then?
2. If so, how many have been replaced and when did the replacements take place?

3. If no additional meter replacements have been made since February 2019, when will the next batch of meters
be replaced? As part of your response, please explain any delay.

4. s the utility on track to complete all meter replacements within the four-year timeframe established by the
Commission in Order No. PSC-2015-0535-PAA-WU?

Thank you in advance for your attention to this request. Please provide a written response no later than September 12,
2019. '

Regards,

Todd M. Brown

Division of Accounting & Finance
Florida Public Service Commission
850.413.6550



Todd Brown

From: simonsjsr@aol.com

Sent: Wednesday, September 11, 2019 1:00 PM
To: Todd Brown

Subject: Re: Cedar Acres Meter Replacements
Yes.

----- Original Message-----

From: Todd Brown <TBrown@PSC.STATE.FL US>
To: 'simonsjsr@aol.com’ <simonsjsr@aol.com>
Sent: Fri, Sep 6, 2019 1:43 pm

Subject: RE: Cedar Acres Meter Replacements

| appreciate the information. Will you be filing for reimbursement from the escrow account after the meters
scheduled for replacement in September are complete?

Hope you have a great weekend.

Thanks,

Todd M. Brown

Division of Accounting & Finance
Florida Public Service Commission
850.413.6550

From: simonsjsr@aol.com [mailto:simonsisr@aol.com]
Sent: Friday, September 06, 2019 12:21 PM

To: Todd Brown
Cc: davidjsimons@aol.com

Subject: Re: Cedar Acres Meter Replacements

----- Original Message-----

From: Todd Brown <TBrown@PSC.STATE.FL.US>

To: 'cedaracresinc@gmail.com' <cedaracresinc@gmail.com>; 'simonsjsr@aol.com’ <simonsjsr@aol.com>; 'davidjsimons@aol.com’
<davidjsimons(@aol.com> ‘

Cc: Charles Murphy <cmurphy@PSC.STATE.FL.US>

Sent: Sun, Sep 1, 2019 3:34 pm

Subject: Cedar Acres Meter Replacements

Good morning. Just wanted to follow-up on the status of Cedar Acres’ meter replacements. As of your escrow reimbursement request
dated February 8, 2019, you indicated that 170 meters had been replaced.

1. Have any additional meters been replaced since then? Yes.

2. If so, how many have been replaced and when did the replacements take place? 24 meters were replaced in March/April of 2019

for a total of 194 replacements.

24 meters are currently on order and should be replaced in September.
3. If no additional meter replacements have been made since February 2019, when will the next batch of meters be replaced? As part
of your response, please explain any delay.
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4. Ts the utility on track to complete all meter replacements within the four-year time frame established by the Commission in Order
No. PSC-2015-0535-PAA-WU?

We expect to have the meters replaced within the time frame established. The 24 meters to be replaced in September will
put us at about 70% completion.

Thank you in advance for your attention to this request. Please provide a written response no later than September 12, 2019.

Regards,

Todd M. Brown :
Division of Accounting & Finance
Florida Public Service Commission
850.413.6550





