
Deposit Date 

MAY 1 7 2024 

FILED 5/17/2024 
DOCUMENT NO. 03275-2024 
FPSC - COMMISSION CLERK 

Raquel Revells 

From: 
Sent: 
To: 
Cc: 

Andrew Kunkler 
Friday, May 17, 2024 12:00 PM 
Raquel Revells 

Cissy Galloway Depos, Number 
Subject: Re: TY1 84 , 

000737 

Yes that $500 is for the non-compliance docket. 

$300 goes to the General Revenue Fund and $200 goes to the PSC trust fund 

On May 17, 2024, at 11 :54 AM, Raquel Revells <RRevells@psc.state.fl.us> wrote: 

Ok, I believe this is a fine, we are do ing a deposit , so please let me know how to apply. Thanks 

Subject: TY184 , 

<image00 1. png> 

Is the Company, paying a $500.00 fine , because they sent in a check fo r $1,244.00 and after 
they pay the RAF they have $500.00. Left over. , and if so does all the $500.00 go to fi nes. 

Or is it split it up between Recovery Cost? 
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