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Purpose 

To: Florida Public Service Commission 

We have performed the procedures described later in this report to meet the objectives set 
forth by the Office of Industry Development and Market Development in its audit service request 
dated December 20, 2023. We have applied these procedures to the attached summary exhibit 
and to several related schedules prepared by Tampa Electric Company in support of its 2023 
filing for the Storm Protection Plan Cost Recovery Clause in Docket No. 20240010-EI. 

The report is intended only for internal Commission use. 
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Objectives and Procedures 

General 

Definition 

Utility refers to the Tampa Electric Company. 

SPPCRC refers to the Stonn Protection Plan Cost Recovery Clause. 

SPP refers to the Storm Protection Plan. 

Capital Investment 

Objectives: The objectives were to audit the following capital investments: Distribution 
Overhead Feeder Hardening Program, Distribution Lateral Undergrounding Program, 
Transmission Assets Upgrade, and Transmission Exchange. In addition, our objectives were to 
1) Verify the investment amounts are recorded in the correct plant accounts; 2) Reconcile the 
corresponding plant-in-service/depreciation base; 3) Verify the calculations of non--interest 
bearing construction work-in-progress (CWIP); 4) Verify the most recent Commission-approved 
depreciation and amortization periods are used in calculating depreciation expenses; and 5) 
Reconcile depreciation savings for retired assets that have depreciation recovered through base 
rates. 

Procedures: We reconciled the capital investments to the Utility's general ledger. We verified 
the calculations of the non-interest bearing CWIP. We also verified that the most recent 
Commission-approved depreciation and ·amortization periods were used in calculating the 
depreciation expenses. We verified that the depreciation savings for retired assets that have 
depreciation recovered through base rates will be recovered, and reconciled them with the 
SPPCRC program-related additions. retirements. and adjustments to the general ledger. 

Objective: The objective was to verify the SPPCRC program-related plant additions, 
retirements, and adjustments for the period January 1 through December 31, 2023. 

Procedures: We reconciled the additions and adjustments to the general ledger. We statistically 
selected SPPCRC program-related plant additions, retirements, and adjustments for testing. 

Expense 

Objectives: The objectives were to reconcile the Vegetation Management Operation and 
Maintenance expenses to the general ledger, and review a statistical or judgmental sample of the 
Transmission and Distribution activities. 

Procedures: We reconciled the Vegetation Management Operation and Maintenance (O&M) 
expenses to the general ledger. We statistically selected invoices/vouchers for transmission and 
distribution activities for testing. We then statistically sampled Vegetation Management O&M 
expenses. No exceptions were noted. 
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Objectives: The objectives were to reconcile the Common SPP Operation and Maintenance 
expenses to the general ledger, and review a statistical or judgmental sample of Common SPP 
Operation and Maintenance expense. 

Procedures: We reconciled the Common SPP O&M expenses to the general ledger. We 
statistically selected invoices/vouchers for Common SPP O&M expenses for testing. No 
exceptions were noted. 

Objective: The objective was to reconcile operation and maintenance expenses of the projects 
listed on Form A-5 of the filing, to the general ledger. 

Procedures: We reconciled the operation and maintenance expenses to the general ledger. We 
statistically selected invoices/vouchers for O&M expenses not already tested (Infrastructure 
Inspection, Maintenance Expenses). No exceptions were noted. 

Other Issues 

Objectives: The objectives were to: 1) Substantiate if the Utility changed any of its accounting 
practices, procedures, or guidelines for purposes of implementing cost recovery through the 
Storm Cost Recovery Clause, and 2) Verify if the Utility changed any of its allocation practices, 
procedures, or guidelines for purposes of implementing cost recovery through the Stonn Cost 
Recovery Clause. 

Procedures: We requested and reviewed the accounting practices, procedures, or guidelines for 
purposes of implementing cost recovery through the Storm Cost Recovery Clause. We reviewed 
whether the Utility changed any of its allocation practices, procedures, or guidelines for purposes 
of implementing cost recovery through the Storm Cost Recovery Clause. We determined that 
that Utility had made changes to its allocation method. No exceptions were noted. 

True-up 

Objective: The objective was to determine whether the True-Up and Interest Provision, as filed, 
was properly calculated. 

Procedures: We verified the True-Up and Interest Provision amounts as of December 31, 2023, 
using the Financial Commercial Paper rates, and 2023 revenues and costs. No exceptions were 
noted. 
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Audit.Findings: 
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