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Florida Public Service Commission 
SUMMARY OF ORDERS ISSUED 

WEEK OF MARCH 21 - 25, 2016 
ELECTRIC AND GAS INDUSTRY 

DOCKET NO. DATE FILED ORDER NO. & DESCRIPTION DOCKET TITLE 

160017-EI 03/21/2016 PSC-16-0115-PAA-EI 
PAA Order PSC-16-0115-PAA-EI approving 
Duke Energy's petition for depreciation rates 
effective 3/15/16; order to become final and 
effective on issuance of CO; if no timely 
protest, docket to be closed; protest due 
4/11/16. 

Petition for approval of depreciation rates for 
solar photovoltaic generating units, by Duke 
Energy Florida, LLC. 

160025-EU 03/21/2016 PSC-16-0116-PAA-EU 
PAA Order PSC-16-0116-PAA-EU approving 
amendment to territorial agreement by OUC 
and Duke Energy; order to become final and 
effective upon issuance of CO; if no timely 
protest, docket shall be closed; protest due 
4/11/16. 

Joint petition for approval of amendment to 
territorial agreement in Orange County, by 
Orlando Utilities Commission and Duke 
Energy Florida, LLC. 

160009-EI 03/21/2016 PSC-16-0117-CFO-EI 
Order PSC-16-0117-CFO-EI granting Duke 
Energy's request for confidential classification 
(of DN 06093-15) for a period of 18 months 
from the date of this order. (Audit Report No. 
PA 15-01-001) 

Nuclear cost recovery clause. 

  03/21/2016 PSC-16-0118-CFO-EI 
Order PSC-16-0118-CFO-EI granting FPL's 
request for extension of confidential 
classification (of DN 06859-09) for a period 
of 18 months from the date of this order. 
(Audit Control No. 08-248-4-2) 

Nuclear cost recovery clause. 

150248-EG 03/21/2016 PSC-16-0119-TRF-EG 
Order PSC-16-0119-TRF-EG approving 
GPC's five-year community solar pilot 
program; termination of the optional PV Rider 
is effective 3/1/16 and all participants shall be 
notified with in 30 days; if a protest is filed 
within 21 days of issuance of the Order, the 
tariff shall remain in effect; if no protest, 
docket shall be closed upon the issuance of a 
CO; protest due 4/11/16. 

Petition for approval of community solar pilot 
program, by Gulf Power Company. 

160001-EI 03/21/2016 PSC-16-0120-PCO-EI 
Order PSC-16-0120-PCO-EI approving FPL's 
petition for mid-course correction; revised 
fuel factors shall be effective with the first 
billing cycle in 4/16; docket to remain open. 

Fuel and purchased power cost recovery 
clause with generating performance incentive 
factor. 

160042-EI 03/21/2016 PSC-16-0122-CFO-EI 
Order PSC-16-0122-CFO-EI granting GPC's 
request for confidential classification (of DN 
00842-16) for a period of 18 months from the 
date of this order; closes docket. 

Gulf Power Company's request for 
confidential classification for the earnings 
surveillance report, supplemental filing for 
December 2015. 
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ELECTRIC AND GAS INDUSTRY 
DOCKET NO. DATE FILED ORDER NO. & DESCRIPTION DOCKET TITLE 

150259-GU 03/24/2016 PSC-16-0124-CFO-GU 
Order PSC-16-0124-CFO-GU granting PGS's 
request for confidential classification (of DN 
01261-16) for a period of 18 months from the 
date of this order. 

Initiation of show cause proceedings against 
Peoples Gas System for apparent violations of 
Sections 368.01 - 05, F.S., and Chapter 25-12, 
F.A.C. 

160021-EI 03/25/2016 PSC-16-0125-PCO-EI 
Order PSC-16-0125-PCO-EI establishing 
procedure. 

Petition for rate increase by Florida Power & 
Light Company. 

 
 

TELECOMMUNICATIONS INDUSTRY 
DOCKET NO. DATE FILED ORDER NO. & DESCRIPTION DOCKET TITLE 

150244-TX 03/21/2016 PSC-16-0121-PAA-TX 
PAA Order PSC-16-0121-PAA-TX granting 
Pure Telephone's application for Certificate of 
Authority No. 8882; order to become final 
and effective on issuance of CO; if no timely 
protest, docket to be closed; protest due 
4/11/16. 

Application for certificate to provide local 
telecommunications service by Pure 
Telephone Corp. 

 
 

WATER AND WASTEWATER INDUSTRY 
DOCKET NO. DATE FILED ORDER NO. & DESCRIPTION DOCKET TITLE 

150071-SU 03/23/2016 PSC-16-0123-PAA-SU 
PAA Order PSC-16-0123-PAA-SU approving 
K W Resort's application for increased water 
rates; K W Resort shall submit documentation 
of all CIAC that has been collected since the 
test year; K W Resort shall file revised tariff 
sheets and approved rates shall be effective on 
or after the stamped approval date; K W 
Resort shall provide proof of the date notice 
was given within 10 days of the date of the 
notice; wastewater rates shall be reduced as 
shown on Schedule No. 4; the decrease in 
rates shall become effective immediately 
following the expiration of the four-year rate 
case expense recovery period; within 90 days 
of an effective date of the Order K W Resort 
shall submit a letter confirming that the 
adjustments to all the applicable NARUC 
USOA accounts have been made; if no 
protest, order to become final and effective 
upon issuance of CO; docket shall remain 
open pending staff's verification, once 
completed docket shall be closed 
administratively; protest due 4/13/16. 

Application for increase in wastewater rates in 
Monroe County by K W Resort Utilities Corp. 

 
 
 


