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Florida Public Service Commission 
SUMMARY OF ORDERS ISSUED 

WEEK OF MARCH 6 - 10, 2017 
ELECTRIC AND GAS INDUSTRY 

DOCKET NO. DATE FILED ORDER NO. & DESCRIPTION DOCKET TITLE 

160186-EI 03/06/2017 PSC-17-0084-CFO-EI 
Order PSC-17-0084-CFO-EI granting GPC's 
request for confidential classification and 
motion for temporary protective order (of DN 
02280-17) for a period of 18 months from the 
date of this order. 

Petition for rate increase by Gulf Power 
Company. 

170022-EI 03/09/2017 PSC-17-0086-NOR-EI 
Order PSC-17-0086-NOR-EI noticing 
rulemaking to amend Rule 25-6.0183 FAC; 
relating to the incorporation of reference into 
the Rule of the 12/15/16 Florida Reliability 
Coordinating Council's Generating Capacity 
Shortage Plan; notice of rulemaking appeared 
in the 3/9/17 FAR; if timely requested, a 
hearing will be held at a time and place to be 
announced in a future notice. 

Proposed amendment of Rule 25-6.0183, 
F.A.C., Electric Utility Procedures for 
Generating Capacity Shortage Emergencies. 

160186-EI 03/09/2017 PSC-17-0087-CFO-EI 
Order PSC-17-0087-CFO-EI granting GPC's 
request for confidential classification and 
motion for temporary protective order (of DN 
02302-17) for a period of 18 months from the 
date of this order. 

Petition for rate increase by Gulf Power 
Company. 

  03/09/2017 PSC-17-0088-CFO-EI 
Order PSC-17-0088-CFO-EI granting GPC's 
request for confidential classification and 
motion for temporary protective order (of DN 
02304-17) for a period of 18 months from the 
date of this order. 

Petition for rate increase by Gulf Power 
Company. 

 
 

WATER AND WASTEWATER INDUSTRY 
DOCKET NO. DATE FILED ORDER NO. & DESCRIPTION DOCKET TITLE 

140217-WU 03/09/2017 PSC-17-0089-FOF-WU 
Order PSC-17-0089-FOF-WU orders Cedar 
Acres to continue compliance with provisions 
of Order PSC-15-0535-PAA-WU and to file a 
billing analysis on or before 7/31/17; docket 
shall remain open to allow staff to analyze the 
billing analysis investigation report, to 
monitor Cedar Acres' progress with the meter 
replacement program, and to administer the 
meter replacement escrow account funds.  
 
 

Application for staff-assisted rate case in 
Sumter County by Cedar Acres, Inc. 
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WATER AND WASTEWATER INDUSTRY 
DOCKET NO. DATE FILED ORDER NO. & DESCRIPTION DOCKET TITLE 

160246-WS 03/09/2017 PSC-17-0090-NOR-WS 
Order PSC-17-0090-NOR-WS noticing 
rulemaking to adopt Rules 25-30.444 and 
25-30.4445 FAC; relating to water and 
wastewater utility reserve funds; notice of 
rulemaking appeared in the 3/9/17 FAR; if 
timely requested, a hearing will be held at a 
time and place to be announced in a future 
notice. 

Proposed adoption of Rule 25-30.444, F.A.C., 
Utility Reserve Fund, and 25-30.4445, F.A.C., 
Notice of Application for Utility Reserve 
Fund. 

 
 

GENERIC DOCKETS 
DOCKET NO. DATE FILED ORDER NO. & DESCRIPTION DOCKET TITLE 

170008-OT 03/08/2017 PSC-17-0085-FOF-OT 
Order PSC-17-0085-FOF-OT authorizing 
appearance as qualified representative to 
Zachary M. Fabish for Sierra Club. 

Applications for qualified representative 
status. 

 
 
 


