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Florida Public Service Commission 
SUMMARY OF ORDERS ISSUED 

WEEK OF SEPTEMBER 21 - 25, 2015 
ELECTRIC AND GAS INDUSTRY 

DOCKET NO. DATE FILED ORDER NO. & DESCRIPTION DOCKET TITLE 

150075-EI 09/23/2015 PSC-15-0401-AS-EI 
Final Order PSC-15-0401-AS-EI approving 
settlement between FPL and the Office of 
Public Counsel; if no timely appeal filed, 
docket to be closed. 

Petition for approval of arrangement to 
mitigate impact of unfavorable Cedar Bay 
power purchase obligation, by Florida Power 
& Light Company. 

150002-EG 09/24/2015 PSC-15-0402-CFO-EG 
Order PSC-15-0402-CFO-EG granting FPL's 
request for extension of confidential 
classification (of DNs 00521-13 and 
05980-07) for 18 months from issuance date 
of this order. (Audit [Control] No. 
07-071-4-3) 

Energy conservation cost recovery clause. 

  09/24/2015 PSC-15-0403-CFO-EG 
Order PSC-15-0403-CFO-EG granting FPL's 
request for extension of confidential 
classification (of DNs 00504-13 and 
07733-02) for 18 months from issuance date 
of this order. (Audit [Control] No. 
02-064-4-1) 

Energy conservation cost recovery clause. 

150007-EI 09/24/2015 PSC-15-0404-CFO-EI 
Order PSC-15-0404-CFO-EI granting FPL's 
first request for extension of confidential 
classification (of DNs 02071-15 and 
03139-13) for 18 months from issuance date 
of this order. (Audit Control No. 13-015-4-1) 

Environmental cost recovery clause. 

150196-EI 09/25/2015 PSC-15-0408-PCO-EI 
Order PSC-15-0408-PCO-EI acknowledging 
intervention by OPC. 

Petition for determination of need for 
Okeechobee Clean Energy Center Unit 1, by 
Florida Power & Light Company. 

 
 

TELECOMMUNICATIONS INDUSTRY 
DOCKET NO. DATE FILED ORDER NO. & DESCRIPTION DOCKET TITLE 

150161-TX 09/22/2015 PSC-15-0397-PAA-TX 
PAA Order PSC-15-0397-PAA-TX granting 
Certificate of Authority No. 8875 to Kuhl 
Group; if no protest, order to become final 
and effective on issuance of CO; docket to be 
closed if order becomes final; protest due 
10/13/15. 

Application for certificate to provide local 
telecommunications service by Kuhl Group 
Inc. 

150119-TX 09/22/2015 PSC-15-0398-PAA-TX 
PAA Order PSC-15-0398-PAA-TX granting 
Certificate of Authority No. 8878 to Pro-Net; 
if no protest, order to become final and 
effective on issuance of CO; docket to be 
closed if order becomes final; protest due 
10/13/15. 

Application for certificate to provide local 
telecommunications service by Pro-Net, Inc. 
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TELECOMMUNICATIONS INDUSTRY 
DOCKET NO. DATE FILED ORDER NO. & DESCRIPTION DOCKET TITLE 

150152-TX 09/22/2015 PSC-15-0399-CO-TX 
Consummating Order PSC-15-0399-CO-TX 
makes Order PSC-15-0347-PAA-TX effective 
and final; closes docket. 

Application for certificate to provide local 
telecommunications service by Goff Network 
Technologies - Florida, Inc. 

150153-TP 09/25/2015 PSC-15-0407-CO-TP 
Consummating Order PSC-15-0407-CO-TP 
makes Order PSC-15-0348-PAA-TP effective 
and final; closes docket. 

2016 State certification §54.313 and §54.314, 
annual reporting requirements for high-cost 
recipients, and certification of support for 
eligible telecommunications carriers. 

 
 

WATER AND WASTEWATER INDUSTRY 
DOCKET NO. DATE FILED ORDER NO. & DESCRIPTION DOCKET TITLE 

150022-WU 09/22/2015 PSC-15-0400-AS-WU 
Order PSC-15-0400-AS-WU approving 
settlement and finalizing show cause order; 
docket shall remain open to process 
settlement payments received and to monitor 
compliance with the terms; docket to be 
administratively closed once all of the terms 
on the Settlement Agreement and all 
outstanding amounts owed by Wildwood have 
been satisfied; should Wildwood breach 
terms, FPSC shall seek to enforce the 
Settlement Agreement. 

Initiation of show cause proceedings against 
Wildwood Water Company in St. Johns 
County for violations of Sections 350.113, 
367.121, 367.145 and 367.161, F.S., and 
Rules 25-30.120 and 25-30.110, F.A.C. 

 
 

GENERIC DOCKETS 
DOCKET NO. DATE FILED ORDER NO. & DESCRIPTION DOCKET TITLE 

150008-OT 09/25/2015 PSC-15-0405-FOF-OT 
Order PSC-15-0405-FOF-OT authorizing 
appearance as qualified representative to 
James S. Whitlock for SACE. 

Applications for qualified representative 
status. 

  09/25/2015 PSC-15-0406-FOF-OT 
Order PSC-15-0406-FOF-OT authorizing 
appearance as qualified representative to Gary 
A. Davis for SACE. 

Applications for qualified representative 
status. 

 
 
 


